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courses in a specific area of interest was particularly beneficial for me to promote my 

professional goals. Having the opportunity to take interdisciplinary courses such as 

SWK/PSY 691 Systems of Care helped me understand other professional roles and how 

we can wor xd other prof
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**Note that the implementation of these Program SLO's began in Fall 2020 thus data are not yet 

collected on all SLOs for all enrolled students in the certificate program. 

 

3. Describe your assessment process in AY21 for these program student learning outcomes, 

including the collection of data, analysis of data, and faculty (and other, e.g., advisory board) 

conversations around the findings. (750 characters or less)  

A substantially revised Assessment Plan was approved in Spring 2020 along with a catalog revision in 

Fall 2020, thus not all measures were collected for each enrolled student. The CMH Committee 

(comprised of faculty from School of Social Work and Psychology Dept) met in the summer 2021 to 

input and review assessment data. This included review of enrollment data. The data collection 

process included gathering and reviewing: 1) Pre- post program self-assessment survey data 

[comparison of means], 2) course grades for two select CMH courses [descriptive stats], 3) grades on 

three assignments [descriptive stats], and 4) an exit Qualtrics survey [descriptive stats and 

qualitative analysis], of which all align to the SLO's. 

 

4. What are the findings and what do they tell the faculty about student learning in your program? 

(750 characters or less) 

AY2020-2021 total graduates (n=2); total new admissions (n=13). Results for the two graduates 

show that on the pre-assessment (5-point scale) the means across the 6 SLOs ranged from 2.5 - 3.5, 

and on the post assessment (same scale) the means ranged from 4.5 - 5.0, indicating an increase in 

competencies across all areas with the lowest in SLO #6. This is not surprising given those students 

did not take PSY 620 where SLO #6 is explicitly integrated. Grades across CMH elective courses had a 

mean of 4.0, grades on competency-based assessment exam were not available (graduates 

completed prior to summer 2021 implementation of this exam); and grades on two specific 

assignments show exceeding expectations across all criteria.   

 

5. Based on the findings, did the faculty make any recommendations for changes to improve 

student achievement of the program student learning outcomes? Please describe the 

recommended action, what improvement in student learning the program hopes to see with 

this change, the proposed timeline, and how the program will know if the change has worked. 

If no recommendations for changes were made, please explain that decision. (750 Characters 

or less) 

The revised curriculum changes and Academic Assessment Plan were implemented in Fall 2020 thus 

the program is only beginning to see the impact of this change. At this time there are no significant 

recommendations for program changes. It appears based on pre-assessment data (n=13) that the 

mean across the 6 SLOs is similar to the graduates with a range of 1.5 - 3, with the lowest ratings on 

SLO #3 and #6. To support continued data collection, it is recommended that during AY21 faculty for 

the three core courses outline alignment of SLOs with course assignments using a backward design 

model to ensure explicit scaffolding throughout the short certificate program.  
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proactive advising, course scheduling practices, etc. UAA is using the following two metrics in 

its cyclical Program Review process, as well as in its reaffirmation of accreditation process. 

These data are included in the most recent IR-Reports Program Review dashboard. Please 

review these data for your program, note any equity gaps, and describe steps you are taking or 

plan to take to close those gaps. 

 

Metric Definition Rationale 

JUNIOR GRADUATION 
RATE - BACCALAUREATE  

The percentage of students who 
graduate with a bachelor's degree 
within four years of first reaching 
junior class status (60 credits). 
Data source: RPTP end-of-term 
freeze files. Disaggregate as per 
accreditation. 

Junior graduation rate (after 60 
credits) can reflect a department's 
success in helping students 
complete their degrees. Within their 
first 60 credits, students typically 
focus on completing GERs and often 
switch majors. Tracking how long it 
takes students to complete their 
degrees after 60 credits, when many 
students have likely committed to a 
specific major, can provide 
actionable information for 
departments. 

COURSE PASS RATES  
BY COURSE LEVEL 
(Undergraduate lower-
division, undergraduate 
upper-division, and 
graduate). 

The percentage of students who 
receive a passing grade (A, B, C, P) 
for all undergraduate students and 
(A, B, P) for graduate students in a 
course offered by a program 
compared to the same rate 
calculated for all courses at that 
level. Based on a 5-year trend. 
Included in the denominator for 
undergraduate courses are the 
grades D, F, W, I, NP, NB. Included 
in the denominator for graduate 
level are the grades C, D, F, W, I, 
NP, NB. Discipline acts as a proxy 
for a program. Data source: RPTP 
end-of-term freeze files. 
Disaggregate as per accreditation. 

Low pass rates are one critical way 
to identify courses that are barriers 
to student success and degree 
completion. Failing key courses 
correlates with low retention and 
more major switching. Mitigation 
strategies can be internal or external 
to the course itself, including, among 
other things, the use of high-impact 
pedagogical practices, appropriate 
placement, course sequencing, 
tutoring, and other means to ensure 
student success within a particular 
course. This metric and the 
disaggregation of the data can 
inform planning, decision making, 
and the allocation of resources to 
programs and services designed to 
mitigate gaps in achievement and 
equity. 
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9. Do you have any examples of post-graduate success you want to highlight? For example, major 

scholarships, the percent of students who pass licensure examinations, the percent of students 

accepted to graduate programs, the percent in post-graduation employment in the field or a 

related field. (750 characters or less) 

Not at this time.   

 

 
 

DEAN SECTION (Due to the program on January 15) 

After completing the Dean Section and signing it, the dean should email this form to the program, and 

copy uaa_oaa@alaska.edu for posting. If the program is delivered on one or more community campus, 

the dean should consult with the appropriate community campus director(s) on the response and copy 

the appropriate community campus director(s) when emailing the response to the program. 
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